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Introduction 
 
Underwater World Singapore, situated on Sentosa Island of Singapore, is a unique and well-known 
oceanarium showcasing some 2500 marine life from 250 species from around the regions and is extremely 
popular with all our visitors for providing fun, leisure and educational experiences. Since our opening in 
1991, more than 20 million visitors have been won over by our exhibits. With our aim to provide every visitor 
with a unique fun filled experience, Underwater World Singapore is actively involved in regular product 
renewal and program innovation. 
 
At Underwater World Singapore, a 'voyage to the bottom of the sea' begins at the water’s edge, with 
shallow rock turtle and ray pools. Be greeted next by brightly colored corals and exotic ocean dwellers 
(including moray eels, sea dragons and jelly fishes) before you embark on a spectacular underwater 
journey through our 83-metre-long moving travelator with a tunnel housing the majestic rays, fearsome 
sharks, great shoals of other fishes and a host of other creatures that inhabit the ocean depths. At the end 
of the underwater tunnel experience, do not miss out on the rare opportunity to exchange some playful 
glances with our graceful dugong, Gracie. Also look out for the latest themed exhibit in our changing exhibit 
hall on the first level. The current theme is the "Living Fossils" exhibiting various unique and amazing 
marine and freshwater creatures, whose ancestors appeared more than a few hundreds of millions years 
ago! 
 
Underwater World Singapore is committed to the conservation and breeding of marine life through active 
involvement in several environmental projects. School visits are actively supported, with educational 
programs like Living in the Ocean Sleepover, Hands-on Educational Fun Workshops, and the Ocean 
Ambassador, encouraging fun learning and understanding of the undersea life and its fragility. Alternatively, 
snuggle up to creatures of the deep by joining our various Dive programs, or pamper yourself with our 
everpopular “Swim with the Dolphins”. 
 
If you are looking for unique exclusive venues to host your events, we offer you fascinating wine and dine 
ideas like “Dinner with the Sharks” (exclusive dining on the moving travelator), and ocean-themed functions. 
Alongside with the theme of the event, we can help you to specially concoct and create a sumptuous 
spread of irresistible delicacies. Open spaces are also available for holding outdoor events at the Dolphin 
Lagoon. Be it corporate functions, incentive parties, product launches, company family days or even 
weddings, the possibilities are endless at Underwater World Singapore and Dolphin Lagoon. 

 


